

OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: October 13, 1999

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32063	2,500.000			No Bid							Iberia
32064	1,250.000			No Bid							Iberia
32065	1,186.290			No Bid							Iberia
32066	648.940			No Bid							Iberia
32067	210.690			No Bid							Iberia
32068	501.830			No Bid							Iberia
32069	915.990	1	263.730	Cockrell Oil & Gas LP	39,981.47	0.2110000					Iberia/St. Mary
32069		2	915.990	Pride Oil & Gas Properties , Inc.	180,001.19	0.2100000	915.990	180,001.19	16556	1	Iberia/St. Mary
32070	507.160			No Bid							St. Mary
32071	109.170			No Bid							St. Mary
32072	634.960			No Bid							St. Mary
32073	1,201.470			No Bid							St. Mary
32074	2,284.840	1	449.650	Rebecca Teal Roberts	63,400.65	0.2100000	449.650	63,400.65	16557	1	Terrebonne
32075	690.320	1	453.690	Rebecca Teal Roberts	77,580.99	0.2100000	453.690	77,580.99	16558	1	Terrebonne
32076	2,292.300			No Bid							Plaquemines
32077	674.370			No Bid							Plaquemines
32078	476.790			No Bid							Plaquemines
Totals	16,085.120		2,083.060		\$360,964.30		1,819.330	\$320,982.83		3	