

OFFSHORE BID TRACT SHEET

DATE: August 9, 2000

Tract Number	Advertised Acreage	No. Bid	Acres Bid	Bidder	Bonus Bid	Royalty	Accepted Acres	Accepted Bonus	State Leases		Parish
32683	1,232.130	1	288.310	Woodland Petroleum Corp.	36,327.06	0.2200000	288.310	36,327.06	16803	1	Cameron
32684	2,500.000	1	822.210	Woodland Petroleum Corp.	103,598.46	0.2200000	822.210	103,598.46	16804	1	Cameron
32685	2,411.780			No Bid							Cameron
32686	1,800.940			No Bid							Cameron
32687	2,500.000			No Bid							Cameron
32688	1,905.190			No Bid							Cameron
32689	2,006.040			No Bid							Cameron
32690	2,500.000			No Bid							Cameron
32691	1,676.360			No Bid							Cameron
32692	2,500.000			No Bid							Cameron
32693	2,034.570			No Bid							Cameron
32694	1,895.290			No Bid							Terrebonne
32695	1,515.150			No Bid							Terrebonne
32696	1,549.900			No Bid							Terrebonne
32697	1,515.150			No Bid							Terrebonne
32698	2,169.650	1	1,066.340	Cheniere Energy, Inc.	218,599.70	0.2200000	1,066.340	218,599.70	16805	1	Terrebonne
32699	1,272.740			No Bid							Terrebonne
32700	1,881.570			No Bid							Terrebonne
32701	2,416.130			No Bid							Terrebonne
32702	1,929.900			No Bid							Terrebonne
32703	2,453.570			No Bid							Terrebonne
32704	1,504.620			No Bid							Terrebonne
32705	2,500.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
32706	966.850			No Bid							Terrebonne
32707	2,500.000			No Bid							Terrebonne
Totals	49,137.530		2,176.860		\$358,525.22		2,176.860	\$358,525.22		3	